Village of Clarendon Hills

International Mechanical and Fuel Gas Code Amendments
(Commercial and Multi-Family Residential Only)

AMENDMENTS TO INTERNATIONAL MECHANICAL CODE: The International
Mechanical Code 2006 as adopted, effective January 1, 2007, is revised and amended as follows:
(1) Section 101.1. Title. - Insert: “Village of Clarendon Hills”

(2) Section 103.1. General. - Replace the section in its entirety with the following: “The
Community Development Department shall serve as the department of mechanical inspection
and the executive official in charge thereof shall be known as the code official.”

(3) Section 106.5.2. Fee schedule. - Replace the section in its entirety with the following: “The
fees for mechanical work shall be as indicated in the appropriate schedules in the Village
Code.”

(4) Section 106.5.3. Fee refunds. - Delete entire section.

(5) Section 109. Means of Appeal. - Delete entire section.

(6) Section 306.3. Appliances in attics. - Add new subsection 306.3.2 as follows:

“306.3.2 Enclosure and venting. Heat producing appliances installed in attic spaces shall be
enclosed within a room sheathed with 5/8 inch drywall that provides adequate access and

space for maintenance and allows sufficient intake of combustion air.”

(7) Section 903.3. Unvented gas log heaters. - Replace the section in its entirety with the
following: “Unvented gas log heaters are not permitted.”

AMENDMENTS TO INTERNATIONAL FUEL GAS CODE: The International Fuel Gas Code
2006 as adopted, effective January 1, 2007, is revised and amended as follows:

(1) Section 101.1. Title. - Insert: “Village of Clarendon Hills”

(2) Section 106.5.2. Fee schedule. - Replace the section in its entirety with the following: “The
fees for work shall be as indicated in the appropriate schedules in the Village Code.”

(3) Section 106.5.3. Fee refunds. - Delete entire section.
(4) Section 109. Means of Appeal. - Delete entire section.
(5) Section [M]306.3. Appliances in attics. - Add new subsection [M]306.3.2 as follows:

“[M]306.3.2 Enclosure and venting. Heat producing appliances installed in attic spaces shall



be enclosed within a room sheathed with 5/8 inch drywall that provides adequate access and
space for maintenance and allows sufficient intake of combustion air.”

(6) Section 403.4.3. Copper and brass. - Replace the section in its entirety with the following:
“Copper and brass pipe shall not be used.”

(7) Section 403.4.4. - Aluminum. Replace the section in its entirety with the following:
“Aluminum-alloy pipe shall not be used.”

(8) Section 403.4.5.2. - Copper and brass tubing. Replace the section in its entirety with the
following: “Copper and brass tubing shall not be used.”

(9) Section 403.4.5.3. - Aluminum tubing. Replace the section in its entirety with the following:
“Aluminum-alloy tubing shall not be used.”

(10)  Section 404.9. Minimum burial depth. - Substitute the phrase “18 inches (457 mm)” for
the phrase “12 inches (305 mm)”.

(11)  Section 404.9.1. Individual outside appliances. - Substitute the phrase “18 inches (457
mm)” for the phrase “8 inches (203 mm)”.

(12)  Section 621.1. Unvented room heaters. - General. Replace the section in its entirety with
the following: “Unvented room heaters are not permitted.”

Any questions concerning the local amendments and/or the International Mechanical Code or the
International Fuel Gas Code can be directed to the Community Development Department at
(630) 323-3500 Ext. 6.

Tnt’l Meachanical and Fuel (Gac (Cade Amendmentc Pace D



