
ORDINANCE NO. 18-12-27 

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTERS 21, 22, 25, AND 26 OF THE CLARENDON HILLS 
VILLAGE CODE IN REGARD TO CONSTRUCTION, FIRE SAFETY, AND 

PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODES 

WHEREAS, the Village of Clarendon Hills regulates building activity, which provides for 

the protection of the public health, safety and welfare of the residents of the Village of Clarendon 

Hills; and 

WHEREAS, the International Code Council, Inc., has developed and updated model 

codes to regulate construction for the protection of public health, safety and welfare; and 

WHEREAS, the National Fire Protection Association, has developed and updated a life 

safety code to regulate construction for the protection of public health, safety and welfare; and 

WHEREAS, the National Fire Protection Association, has developed and updated an 

electric code to regulate construction for the protection of public health, safety and welfare; and 

WHEREAS, the President and Board of Trustees may from time to time amend the text of 

the Clarendon Hills Village Code when it is determined to be in the best interests of the Village; 

and 

WHEREAS, the President and Board of Trustees of the Village of Clarendon Hills have 

determined that the Village's building codes and life safety code should be revised and updated; 

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED by the President and Board of Trustees of the 

Village of Clarendon Hills, DuPage County, Illinois, as follows: 

SECTION 1: Effective February 1, 2019, Chapter 21 of the Clarendon Hills Village Code 

is hereby amended to read in its entirety as provided for in EXHIBIT A, attached hereto. 



SECTION 2: Effective February 1, 2019, Chapter 22 of the Clarendon Hills Village Code 

is hereby amended to read in its entirety as provided for in EXHIBIT B, attached hereto. 

SECTION 3: Effective February 1, 2019, Chapter 25 of the Clarendon Hills Village Code 

is hereby amended to read in its entirety as provided for in EXHIBIT C, attached hereto. 

SECTION 4: Effective February 1, 2019, Chapter 26 of the Clarendon Hills Village Code 

is hereby deleted in its entirety. 

SECTION 5: All Ordinances or parts of Ordinances in conflict or which are inconsistent 

with this Ordinance shall be repealed to the extent of any such conflict or inconsistency. 

SECTION 6: This Ordinance shall be in full force and effect from and after its adoption, 

approval and publication in pamphlet form, as provided by law. 

ADOPTED this 3rd day of December, 2018, pursuant to a roll call vote as follows: 

AYES: Trustees Freve, Hall, Jordan, Jorissen, Knoll, & McGarrah 

NAYS: None 

ABSENT: None 

APPROVED by me this 3rd day of December, 201 

ATTEST: 

k rn. . -r;;;.dt,__.. 
Dawn M. Tandie, Village Clerk 

Published in pamphlet form: December 4, 2018 

Page 2 of 2 

































EXHIBIT A - CHAPTER 21: BUILDING CODE Printed 11/28/2018 

 

Page 16 

In determining a structure's premodification floor area, the floor area of any portion of the structure which is/will be 

demolished in order to proceed with the modifications to the structure shall not be counted. As such, the formula for 

calculating the premodification floor area of a structure for purposes of this subsection B(2) shall be as follows: 

(a) If the modification occurs on or before October 26, 2010: 

Floor area of the structure on  

October 27, 2005 (the "original floor area")   

- That portion of the original floor area 

being demolished to facilitate the 

modification of the structure   

= Premodification 

floor area   

 

(b) If the modification occurs on or after October 27, 2010: 

Floor area of the structure on the date five (5) 

years prior to the date of modification (the 

"original floor area")   

- That portion of the original floor area 

being demolished to facilitate the 

modification of the structure   

= Premodification 

floor area   

 



EXHIBIT B - CHAPTER 22: ELECTRICAL CODE Printed 12/4/2018 

 

 
Page 1 

22.1: DEFINITIONS: 

For purposes of this chapter, the following terms shall be defined as set forth below, unless otherwise defined within a 

specific section or subsection of this chapter: 

ELECTRICAL EQUIPMENT: Conductors and equipment installed for the utilization of electricity applied for light, heat or 

power, but does not include radio apparatus or equipment for wireless reception of sounds and signals, nor ordinary 

household appliances such as toasters, vacuum cleaners, washing machines, and does not include apparatus, conductors 

and other equipment under the jurisdiction of the Illinois commerce commission, for use in their operation as a public 

utility.  

NEW CONSTRUCTION: Shall be defined as set forth in section 21.17 of this code. 

22.2: ELECTRICAL INSPECTOR: 

A. Duties: The electrical inspector appointed by the village manager shall perform the functions of an electrical inspection 

department as prescribed by the Illinois municipal code, for the regulation of the installation, alteration and use of electrical 

equipment, and shall be charged with the duty of enforcing the statutes, ordinances and rules and regulations relating to 

the installation, alteration and use of electrical equipment. 

B. Records: The village shall keep complete records of all permits and certificates issued and inspections made in accordance 

with this chapter, and other official work performed, which records shall be open to inspection at the village hall in 

accordance with Regulations of the Illinois State Local Records Commission. 

22.3: NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE: 

A. Adoption: The standards and specifications of the national electrical code NFPA no. 70 (2014) and the International Code 

Council electrical code-administrative provisions (2015) as may be amended from time to time and as amended below and 

forthcoming are hereby adopted as the standards and specifications and minimum rules and regulations for the installation, 

alteration, repair and use of electrical equipment, subject, however, to additional standards, rules and regulations set forth 

in this chapter and except where they are in conflict with other provisions of this code. Where they are in conflict the 

standards and regulations set forth in the national electrical code shall prevail. 

B. Amendments To National Electric Code: The 2014 national electrical code is revised and amended as follows: 

Section 220.82 Dwelling - Add the following new subsection: "(D) Optional Calculation-Dwelling Unit. All single family 

units having living space less than two thousand square (2,000) feet shall utilize a minimum one hundred (100) ampere 

service excluding the requirements of electrical heating, if any. Dwellings having living space greater than two thousand 

(2,000) square feet shall utilize a minimum of two hundred (200) ampere service exclusive of electrical heating." 

Section 230.70(A)(1) Readily Accessible Location. Delete this section and insert the following "Readily Accessible 

Location. The service disconnection means shall be installed at a readily accessible location outside of a building or 

structure nearest the point of entrance of the service conductors. The door from any room containing a three-phase, 

commercial service shall be equipped with panic bar hardware and shall swing out in the direction of egress from the 

room." 

Section 324.10 Uses Permitted. - Delete this section and insert the following: "Flat conductor cable (type FCC) shall be 

prohibited." 

Section 326.10 Uses Permitted. - Delete this section and insert the following: "Integrated gas spacer cable (type IGS) 

shall be prohibited." 



EXHIBIT B - CHAPTER 22: ELECTRICAL CODE Printed 12/4/2018 

 

 
Page 2 

Section 328.10 Uses Permitted. - Delete this section and insert the following: "Medium voltage cable (type MV) shall be 

prohibited." 

Section 332.10 Uses Permitted. - Delete this section and insert the following:  "Mineral-insulated, metal-sheathed cable 

(type MI) shall be prohibited." 

Section 334.10 Uses Permitted - Delete this section and insert the following:  "Nonmetallic-sheathed cable (types NM, 

NMC and NMS) shall be prohibited." 

Section 338.10 Uses Permitted - Delete this section and insert the following:  "Service entrance cable (types SE and USE) 

shall be prohibited." 

Section 340.1 Scope - Add the following sentence: "Underground feeder and branch-circuit cable shall be a listed type 

UF copper cable in sizes no. 14 through no. 4/0". 

Section 340.10 Uses Permitted - Delete subsection (4) in its entirety. 

Section 352.10 Uses Permitted - Delete (A), (B), (C), (D), (E), (F) and (H). Paragraph (G) remains as written. 

Section 354.10 Uses Permitted - Add subsection: "(5) Non-metallic underground conduit with conductors used for direct 

burial under streets, highways, and parking lots shall be placed at a depth at least thirty-six inches (36") below grade." 

Section 362.10 Uses Permitted - Delete this section and insert the following:  "Electrical nonmetallic tubing (ENT) shall 

be prohibited." 

Section 394.10 Uses Permitted - Delete this section and insert the following: "Concealed knob and tube wiring shall be 

prohibited." 

Section 396.10 Uses Permitted - Delete this section and insert the following: "Messenger supported wiring shall be 

prohibited." 

Section 398.10 Uses Permitted - Delete this section and insert the following: "Open wiring on insulators shall be 

prohibited." 

C. Amendments To Administrative Provisions: The 2015 International Code Council electrical code - administrative 

provisions are hereby revised and amended as follows: 

Section 101.1 - Insert: "Village of Clarendon Hills" 

Section 404.2. Schedule Of Permit Fees. - Insert: "See schedule S22 of the Clarendon Hills village code" 

Section 404.5. Refunds. - Delete entire section. 

Chapter 11. Means Of Appeal. - Delete entire chapter. 

Section 1202.2. Nonmetallic-Sheathed Cable. - Delete this section and as a substitute insert the following sentence: 

"The use of nonmetallic-sheathed cable (types NM, NMC and NMS) shall be prohibited."   

22.4: ADDITIONAL STANDARDS AND SPECIFICATIONS: 

A. Conduit: Only heavy wall rigid metal conduit or intermediate metallic conduit shall be used in all poured concrete on or 

below grade. 

(1) Conduits smaller than three-quarter inch (3/4") in concrete are not permitted. 

(2) EMT is not permitted in concrete or outdoors. 

(3) PVC #40, rigid galvanized or intermediate conduit may be used for underground service. 



EXHIBIT B - CHAPTER 22: ELECTRICAL CODE Printed 12/4/2018 

 

 
Page 3 

B. Commercial Service: Minimum service size for commercial building shall be one hundred (100) amp, single phase or three 

(3) phase. 

C. Metallic Protection: Low voltage (not to exceed 50 volts) may be installed in plenums without metallic protection (except 

where passing through partitions or subject to mechanical injury) when cable listed by Underwriters' Laboratories, Inc. (UL) 

for this purpose is utilized. 

D. Twin Or Tandem Breakers: Twin or tandem breakers are not acceptable for new work. 

E. Construction Plans: Where new construction or alteration work involves electrical work of any type, the construction 

plans shall include a complete wiring plan that contains the following information: 

(1) Number and locations of outlets. 

(2) Size of wire and insulation type conduit. 

(3) Number of circuits and their ampere rating. 

(4) Location of service entrance equipment. 

(5) Location of major appliances. 

(6) Size of existing service. 

(7) Location of all panel boards and cabinets. 

(8) Sizes of all motors and power consuming equipment and their ratings. 

(9) Electrically heated homes shall have the location and wattage of all heating equipment and the corresponding 

circuits. 

(10) Specifications and locations for all exit and emergency lights. 

(11) Provide schedule on lighting and power panels. 

F. Village Review And Approval: All plans must be reviewed and approved by the village. All installations must be approved 

by the electrical inspector in the field. 

G. Ground Electrode Clamp: An approved nonferrous metal tag shall be attached to the ground electrode clamp giving 

warning against its removal. 

H. Commercial Wiring: All commercial wiring shall be minimum no. 12 gauge wire, except low voltage wiring. 

I. Thin Wall/Aluminum Heavy Wall Conduit: Thin wall (EMT) conduit shall not be used for electrical services. Aluminum 

heavy wall conduit, if used, shall be installed above grade only. 

J. Switches: All rooms with multiple entrances or exits which are more than six feet (6') apart shall utilize 3-way or 4-way 

switches unless an alternate arrangement is approved by the building inspector. 

K. Service Run Location: Service runs should not be located on chimneys or on fire or parapet walls. 

L. Exterior Lighting: No exterior light fixture or fixtures shall be installed so as to cause light in excess of 0.5 foot-candle 

when measured on any adjacent residential property.  

22.5: PERMITS: 



EXHIBIT B - CHAPTER 22: ELECTRICAL CODE Printed 12/4/2018 

 

 
Page 4 

No person shall install electrical equipment without a permit therefor unless specifically exempted therefrom by provisions 

of the national electrical code or this code. Permits for installation, alteration and use of electrical equipment shall first be 

issued only on receipt of an application submitted to the building commissioner, and upon payment of the fee set forth in 

schedule S22 of this code. 

22.6: INSPECTION AND OPERATION: 

No electrical outlets shall be closed or work covered before notice is given to the electrical inspector giving ample time to 

make an inspection. No electrical equipment shall be placed in operation until approved by the inspector. 

22.7: WORK BY HOMEOWNER: 

A person owning and living in a single-family residence may do electrical work in that person's home, but such work shall 

be inspected by the village electrical inspector or certified by a licensed electrician. 

22.8: CONTRACTOR'S BOND AND LICENSE: 

Any person engaged in the business of installing, repairing, or altering electrical service and distribution shall, before 

engaging therein in the village, deposit with the village a bond in the sum of ten thousand dollars ($10,000.00), and submit 

their current electrical license.  



EXHIBIT C - CHAPTER 25: PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE Printed 12/4/2018 
 

Page 1   

25.1: ADOPTION: 

The rules and regulations for the maintenance of all buildings and structures, as published in the international property 

maintenance code, 2015 edition, by the International Code Council, Inc., are hereby adopted and incorporated by reference, 

as if fully set forth herein, as part of the property maintenance code for the village. A copy of the ICC international property 

maintenance code, herein adopted, shall be kept available in the community development department at the village hall, 

for use, inspection and examination. 

25.2: AMENDMENTS TO THE INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE: 

The international property maintenance code, 2015 edition, as heretofore adopted, is hereby amended by the following 

additions, insertions, and deletions: 

Section 101.1 Title: Insert: "Village of Clarendon Hills" 

Section 109.6 Hearing: Substitute the words "village board" for the words "appeals board". 

Section 111 Means Of Appeal: Delete entire section. 

Section 302.4 Weeds. Insert: "eight inches (8")" 

Section 304.14 Insect screens. Insert the dates "April 1" and "October 1"; 

Section 505.1 General: Substitute the words "Illinois plumbing code" for the words "international plumbing code". 

Section 602.2 Residential Occupancies. Substitute the words "70 degrees F (21 degrees C)" for the words "68 degrees 

F (20 degrees C)". 

Section 602.3 Heat Supply. Insert the dates "October 1" and "June 1"; substitute the words "70 degrees F (21 degrees 

C)" for the words "68 degrees F (20 degrees C)". 

Section 602.4 Occupiable Work Spaces. Insert the dates "October 1" and "June 1"; substitute the words "68 degrees F 

(20 degrees C)" for the words "65 degrees F (18 degrees C)". 


